
   
 
 

3B 
WOW  
Grace  
Grace has enjoyed our arts week and was fascinated by making spirolaterals during our maths lesson. 
Keep it up! 
 
STARWRITER 
 
James 
James has written a great poem all about who he is connected with. He used a range of poetic features 
and performed he poem with great confidence. Well done! 
 
POLITENESS 
Alfie  
Alfie has been a kind member of the class and supports his friends whenever he can. Well done! 
 

 

3BR 
WOW  
Conor and Tallulah – for persevering with the bike lesson. I was very impressed Conor, that when you 
had a fall, you got back up with some encouragement and gave it another go. Tallulah, you thought 
about what you were finding tricky and found the confidence to work on a certain part of your biking. You 
both impressed me, well done! 
 
 
 
STARWRITER 
Sebi for writing an excellent poem using a waterfall of verbs! Very interesting to read, very proud. Well 
done Sebi.  
 
 
POLITENESS 

Cooper – for always remembering to use pleases and thank yous. Well done Cooper 😊  

 
 
 
 

 

3T 
WOW – Harry.  For an excellent Iron Man wire sculpture.  You followed the instructions carefully and 
your finished sculpture looked brilliant!  Well done Harry.   
 
STARWRITER – Amine.  For a brilliant poem about your brother.  You tried hard with your ambitious 
vocabulary and made your poem funny.  Well done Amine! 
 
POLITENESS – Callum.  Always polite and remembers to use his STEP every day in school.  Well done 
Callum! 
 
 
 
 



   
 

 
 
 

 

4B 
WOW Laura- for drawing an excellent self portrait during Arts week. Laura used water colours effectively 
and included lots of lovely drawings of things that are important to her. Well done! 
 
 
STARWRITER- Gabi- for writing two super poems using a Haiku and Cinquain structure accurately. Gabi 
showed she has a great understanding of syllables used in these types of poems.  
 
 
 
POLITENESS- Millie- for being so polite and always remembering to use her manners.  
 
 

 

4BT 
WOW – Dolly-Louise – for working hard this week even with a bad wrist which made writing hard. Well 
done Dolly!  
 
 
 
 
STARWRITER – Vito – for writing a lovely limerick about his interests. Well done Vito!  
 
 
 
 
POLITENESS – Emmie – for always being kind to others and having lovely manners. Well done Emmie!  
 
 
 

 

4W 
WOW Sienna B – for drawing a lovely self portrait of herself for Access Arts Week. Well done Sienna!  
 
 
 
 
STARWRITER Fela – for writing an excellent poem about herself and her love of reading. It was also 
beautifully presented. Well done Fela!  
 
 
 
 
POLITENESS Joshua C-A – for being extremely polite and helpful to the teachers in 4W this week.  
 
 
 
 



   
 

 
 

 
 

5B 
WOW   All of 5B for working really hard for Mrs Wylie all week and being fantastically behaved making 
her very proud.  
 
STARWRITER  Eric N  for a well thought out touching poem about his basketball coach including 
many interesting language features.  
 
 
POLITENESS   Zach D for being kind polite and thoughtful to everyone in class. Offering help and 
support to all.  
 

 

5P 
WOW  
5P. For showing a brilliant attitude towards the activities we completed during Access All Arts week and I 
was very impressed by the standard of their work.  Well done, everyone. 
 
STARWRITER 
Sonny. G I was very pleased by his recount of Year Five’s trip to Hall Mead. His work was interesting to 
read, because he organised his information and showed what he really enjoyed about the trip. Great 
Work. 
 
POLITENESS 
Politeness Award. Given to Nadiya. R 
 

 

5W 
 
WOW    Rosie Q for having the highest score in the class in the school spelling bee!  AMAZING!  
 
 
 
 
STARWRITER    Charlotte A for an amazing free verse poem about her connection to her friend 
for Active Arts theme week.  
 
 
 
 
POLITENESS       Adam C 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



   
 

YEAR 6 
WOW  
Victoria R for being a super star helper this week. She was amazing with making and organising the 

decorations for an upcoming event! Thank you 😊 

 
 
WOW 
Harry P for participating well during our junior citizenship trip. You were a good role model for your 
peers. 
 
 
POLITENESS 
 
Namya P for always being polite, kind and inspiring. 
 
 

 

 

 

 


